Form -1

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD
2026 CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, ITEM 4
BID JANUARY 13, 2026

Corrugated Metal Pipe - Helical Corrugation

Jensen Bridge Contech
Diameter Galvanized Polymer Coated Aluminized Galvanized Polymer Aluminized
Round Corrugation _ Gage | Pipe Pipe Type Il Pipe Pipe Coated Pipe  Type Il Pipe
12" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14
12" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 16
15" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14 $12.45 $20.50 $14.30 $19.50 $25.55 $22.25
15" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 16
18" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 14 $14.82 $24.85 $17.35 $23.40 $31.40 $26.65
18" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 16
24" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14 $19.45 $33.50 $23.45 $30.05 $38.70 $34.25
24" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 16
30" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14 $25.40 $41.33 $29.01 $38.40 $49.25 $43.75
36" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14 $30.53 $50.17 $35.40 $46.10 $59.20 $51.60
42" 2-2/3" x 1/2" 14 $35.76 $79.42 $42.11 $53.70 $69.10 $61.21
48" 3"x1" 14 $49.46 $82.26 $53.84 $68.50 * $91.25 * $78.75 *
60" 3"x1" 12 $82.69 $136.17 $89.85 $110.60 * $149.30 * $126.08 *
72" 3"x1" 10 $128.79 $200.69 $139.69 $166.40 © $24525 * $188.95 *
Arch Pipe
17" x 13" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 14 $13.07 $21.53 $15.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21" x 15" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 14 $15.56 $26.09 $18.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24'x 18" 2-2/3"x 1/2" 14 $17.37 $31.41 $21.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28" x 20" 2-2/3"x1/2" 14 $20.42 $36.85 $24.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BANDS
12" per foot 1.75x 2.50x
24" per foot 2x 2.5x
Firm Price April 1, 2026 90 days
*5"X1"

ltems have to be shipped in full
truck load quantities or add $400
in additional freight costs.

*** Cadillac Culvert, Inc. submitted a bid that was late and it was returned unopened.

Bid awarded to Jensen Bridge.
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