ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2026 LIMESTONE AGGREGATES, ITEM #3a

BID January 13, 2026

Private Dock

|_ 2025
[Other Limestone A
Blue Water Detroit St. Clair Blue Water Detroit
PER TON Aggregate (1) Bulk (2) Aggregate (2) Aggregate (1) Bulk (2)
6AA LIMESTONE 24.55 $ 22.69 $ 24.00 $ 23.78 $ 22.04
21AA LIMESTONE 19.29 $ 17.94 $ 18.40 $ 18.51 $ 1845
22A LIMESTONE 19.29 $ 17.94 $ 18.40 $ 18.51 $ 18.45
23A LIMESTONE 19.29 $ 17.74 $ 18.40 $ 18.51 $ 18.45
29A LIMESTONE No Bid $ 28.64 No Bid No Bid $ 2764
31A LIMESTONE 25.55 $ 29.94 No Bid $ 24.55 $ 29.04
QUARRY STONE (3 x 5) 26.80 $ 25.69 No Bid $ 25.73 $ 27.64
QUARRY STONE (CS-2) No Bid $ 29.64 No Bid No Bid $ 27.64

(1) Port Huron Area
(2) Marine City Area

Bid awarded to Blue Water Aggregates, Detroit Bulk and St. Clair Aggregates based on price and

availability at time of need.
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