

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
 2025 Signs, Blanks, & Sheeting, Item #6
 Bid January 14, 2025

	Vulcan	Sign Solutions	2024 Awarded to Vulcan	% Change
Complete Signs				
Stop, R1-1, 30"	\$ 39.12	\$ 50.94	\$ 37.27	20.82%
Stop Ahead, W3-1A, 30"	\$ 42.25	\$ 61.99	\$ 41.37	25.99%
Stop Ahead, W3-1A, 36"	\$ 60.84	\$ 48.15	\$ 59.58	
Target Arrow, W1-6, 48" x 96"	\$ 216.32	No Bid	No Bid	
Bi-Directional, W1-7, 48" x 96"	\$ 216.32	No Bid	No Bid	
Do Not Enter RS-1 36" x 36"	\$ 59.58	\$ 73.36	\$ 46.88	41.79%
Wrong Way RS-1A 24" x 36"	\$ 39.72	\$ 52.73	\$ 37.92	21.89%
Reflective Sheeting - Pressure Sensitive				
<u>High Intensity Flexible Prismatic:</u>				
8" Diagonal Left Barricade (3336L or equivalent)	\$ 127.27	\$ 215.56	\$ 123.86	38.39%
8" Diagonal Right Barricade (3336R or equivalent)	\$ 127.27	\$ 215.56	\$ 123.86	38.39%
<u>Engineering Grade Sheeting:</u>				
Standard				
15"	\$ 174.38	No Bid	\$ 166.87	4.50%
24"	\$ 279.00	No Bid	\$ 267.00	4.49%
30"	\$ 348.75	No Bid	\$ 333.75	4.49%
36"	\$ 418.50	No Bid	\$ 400.50	4.49%
<u>High Intensity Prismatic Grade:</u>				
Standard				
15"	\$ 260.63	\$ 311.22	\$ 238.12	20.07%
24"	\$ 417.00	\$ 415.00	\$ 381.00	9.19%
30"	\$ 521.25	\$ 517.26	\$ 476.25	9.03%
36"	\$ 581.72	\$ 608.43	\$ 571.50	4.12%

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
 2025 Signs, Blanks, & Sheeting, Item #6
 Bid January 14, 2025

	Vulcan	Sign Solutions	2024 Awarded to Vulcan	% Change
Reflective Sheeting - Pressure Sensitive (cont.)				
Diamond Grade				
Standard				
15"	\$ 474.38	\$ 587.15	\$ 466.87	13.69%
24"	\$ 759.00	\$ 814.33	\$ 747.00	5.31%
30"	\$ 948.75	\$ 1,062.55	\$ 933.75	7.70%
36"	\$ 1,138.50	\$ 1,262.79	\$ 1,120.50	7.15%
Florescent				
15"	\$ 474.38	\$ 587.15	\$ 466.87	13.69%
24"	\$ 759.00	\$ 814.33	\$ 747.00	5.31%
30"	\$ 948.75	\$ 1,062.55	\$ 933.75	7.70%
36"	\$ 1,138.50	\$ 1,262.79	\$ 1,120.50	7.15%
Aluminum Sign Blanks and Miscellaneous				
Aluminium sign blank materia (per sq ft)	\$ 3.150	\$ 4.100	\$ 3.00	21.04%
3/4" sealed plywood (per sq ft)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Black Scotchal Marking Film (3M) - 50 yd roll				
6" wide	\$ 75.75	\$ 128.27	\$ 96.75	5.44%
12" wide	\$ 151.50	\$ 245.13	\$ 193.50	2.49%
15" wide	\$ 189.38	\$ 303.55	\$ 241.87	1.90%
24" wide	\$ 303.00	\$ 364.33	\$ 387.00	-13.78%
36" wide	\$ 454.50	\$ 560.11	\$ 580.50	-12.61%
ElectroCut Film - 50 yard roll				
24" wide	\$ 321.00	\$ 283.47	\$ 306.00	-1.23%
30" wide	\$ 401.25	\$ 348.22	\$ 382.50	-2.03%
36" wide	\$ 481.50	\$ 438.82	\$ 459.00	0.25%

Bid awarded to Vulcan.