
ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2024 NATURAL AGGREGATES, ITEM #13

Bid January 9, 2024

PER NET TON
 Mid Michigan 
Materials (A) 

 Weber Sand 
& Gravel 

 2023 Weber, 
Mid Michigan  % Change

6A Commerical: 18.00$             No Bid

21AA Natural Aggregate: 19.50$             19.50$               0.00%

22A Natural Aggregate: 11.00$             9.35$             9.00$                 3.89%

23A Natural Aggregate: 11.00$             9.35$             9.00$                 3.89%

29A Natural Aggregate: No Bid

31A Natural Aggregate: No Bid

5/8"  X 3/8 25.00$             20.00$               25.00%

Quarry Stone (3 x 5) No Bid

CS-2 22.50$               -100.00%

(A) Prices good for Wilson Pit and Bechtel Pit in Brown City

Staff recommends awarding the bid to Mid Michigan Materials and Weber Sand & Gravel based on price and availabilty
at time of need
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