

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
 2021 UNDERBODY SCRAPER BLADES - TUNGSTEN CARBIDE INSERTS, ITEM #9
 BID JANUARY 13, 2020

Through Hardened Steel - Double Bevel						
(PER FOOT)	Winter Equip	Mich Cat	Valk	Wear Parts & Equip	2020 Valk	% Change
3/4"x 8"x6' Straight Edge (Unit Price per foot)	\$13.94	\$14.77	\$14.15	\$14.88	\$13.04	6.90%
Wt./Ft.	18.33	18.50	18.72	18.33	18.70	
Cost / #	\$0.761	\$0.798	\$0.756	\$0.812	\$0.697	8.40%
3/4"x 8"x7' Straight Edge (Unit price per foot)	\$13.93	\$14.65	\$14.15	\$14.88	\$13.04	6.83%
Wt./Ft.	18.29	18.07	18.72	18.29	18.70	
Cost / #	\$0.762	\$0.811	\$0.756	\$0.814	\$0.697	8.40%
3/4"x 6"x6' Serrated Edge (Unit price per foot)	\$11.65	No Bid	\$13.00	\$12.45	\$11.49	1.39%
Wt./Ft.	11.17		10.60	11.17	10.60	
Cost / #	\$1.043		\$1.226	\$1.115	\$1.084	-3.78%

Bid for Through Hardened Steel blades awarded to Winter Equipment.

High Carbon Steel						
(PER FOOT)	Winter Equip	Mich Cat	Valk	Wear Parts & Equip	2020 Winter Equip	%Change
5/8" x 8" x 9' Reverse Curve Blade (Unit price per foot)						
<i>Curved Single beveled along the top edge</i>	\$ 9.62	No Bid	\$ 14.30	\$ 10.89	\$ 10.81	-11.01%
Weight per foot	15.44		16.21	15.44	15.44	
<i>Cost per pound</i>	\$ 0.623		\$ 0.882	\$ 0.705	\$ 0.700	-11.01%

Bid for High Carbon Steel blades awarded to Winter Equipment.

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
 2021 UNDERBODY SCRAPER BLADES - TUNGSTEN CARBIDE INSERTS, ITEM #9
 BID JANUARY 13, 2020

Scraper Blades with Tungsten Carbide Inserts						
	Winter Equip	Mich Cat	Valk	Wear Parts & Equip	2020 Valk	%Change
(PER FOOT)						
7/8" x 5" x 4' with 3/4" Standard punch carbide grader blades with 3/4" deep rectangular tips (Unit price per foot)	\$52.18	No Bid	\$49.86	\$55.73	\$52.37	-4.79%
Stated Weight in ounces - One inch insert	15.0000		2.1000	2.0800	2.1100	
<u>Actual</u> Weight in ounces - One inch insert	2.0500		2.1000	2.1000	2.1000	
<i>Cost per ounce</i>	\$2.121		\$1.979	\$2.212	\$2.078	

Bid for Tungsten Carbide Inserts awarded to Valk Mfg.

Cutting Tips						
	Winter Equip	Mich Cat	Valk	Wear Parts & Equip	2020 Winter Equip	
Scarifier tool with square washer (50 per bucket) Price Each	\$5.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.20	\$ 6.25	-7.20%
SANDVIK K1LW-2244-2869 or equivalent						

Bid for Cutting Tips awarded to Winter Equipment.