

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION  
 2021 LIMESTONE AGGREGATES - PRIVATE DOCK, ITEM #3a  
 BID January 13, 2021

Limestone Specification	Blue Water Aggregate (1)	Detroit Bulk (2)	St. Clair Aggregate (2)	2020 Detroit Bulk	
PER TON					
6AA LIMESTONE	\$ 17.50	\$ 16.99	\$ 17.95	\$ 16.42	3.47%
21AA LIMESTONE	\$ 13.20	\$ 12.40	\$ 12.15	No Bid	
22A LIMESTONE	\$ 13.20	\$ 12.40	\$ 12.15	No Bid	
23A LIMESTONE	\$ 13.20	\$ 12.40	\$ 12.15	No Bid	
29A LIMESTONE	No Bid	\$ 18.92	No Bid	\$ 18.42	2.71%
31A LIMESTONE	\$ 18.15	\$ 18.92	No Bid	\$ 18.42	-1.47%
QUARRY STONE (3 x 5)	\$ 19.10	\$ 20.75	No Bid	\$ 18.42	3.69%
QUARRY STONE (CS-2)	No Bid	\$ 18.92	No Bid	\$ 18.42	2.71%

- (1) Port Huron Area  
 (2) Marine City Area

**Bid awarded to all bidders based on price and availability at time of need.**