

ST. CLAIR COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
 2018 NATURAL AGGREGATES, ITEM #13
 Bid January 24, 2018

PER NET TON	Mid Michigan Materials	Weber Sand & Gravel	2017 Weber & Mid Michigan	% Change
6AA Natural Aggregate:	\$ 14.75	no bid	\$ 13.65	8.06%
21AA Natural Aggregate:	\$ 16.25	no bid	\$ 13.90	16.91%
22A Natural Aggregate:	\$ 7.50	\$ 6.25	\$ 5.65	10.62%
23A Natural Aggregate:	\$ 7.50	\$ 6.25	\$ 5.65	10.62%
29A Natural Aggregate:	\$ 19.85	no bid	\$ 14.60	35.96%
31A Natural Aggregate:	no bid	no bid	no bid	
5/8" X 3/8	\$ 20.50	no bid	\$ 14.60	40.41%
Quarry Stone (3 x 5)	\$ 32.00	no bid	\$ 30.00	6.67%
CS-2	\$ 19.85	no bid	\$ 14.60	35.96%

Bid awarded to all bidders based on price and availability at time of need.